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Teaching the Faith, Technology, and Education 
Technology is not a neutral tool; it is values laden. Christian educa-
tors have both the challenge and the opportunity to help learners 
discover this, recognize the relevance of God’s Word upon life in a 
technological age, and learn how to face the challenges and em-
brace the opportunities of faith, life, and learning in the contemporary 
landscape. To do so, we must also reconsider how we go about the 
good and important work of Christian education in the 21

st
 century. 

This monograph strives to support, illustrate, and explain these 
claims, offering next steps for those invested in contemporary Chris-
tian education. 
 
Technology is Values Laden 
If you have attended a presentation on educational technology in 
Christian schools, you probably have heard presenters comment, “It 
is not about the technology.” They usually continue by claiming that 
“technology is just a tool.” This tool-based approach to technology 
makes intuitive sense, but it also risks missing several important 
facts about the role of technology in faith, life, and learning. I offer a 
definition of technology that has promise to serve us in thinking more 
deeply about the nature and role of technology in Christian educa-
tion, as well as to give us an important clarification about the role of 
values in technology. 
 
If technology is just a tool, what is a tool? One common definition 
states, “a device or implement, especially one held in the hand, used 
to carry out a particular function.” In other words, specific tools are 
created only for specific uses. A hammer is not good or bad. It is just 
a tool. If we claim that a hammer is just a tool, and that it all depends 
upon how we use it, then we might conclude that it is not the fault of 
the hammer if someone happens to use it to hit another person on 
the head, and that would be a reasonable claim. However, it is a fact 
that most hammers are created to hit things. In fact, different ham-
mers are created to hit different things. While it is not the intent of a 
hammer to hit a person on the head, one is more likely to do that 
with unpleasant results than if the same person were holding a pil-
low. Consequently, we are more comfortable letting small children 
play with pillows than with hammers. When they are old enough to 
understand the benefits and dangers of using a hammer, we let 
them use such tools. Some hammers have specific uses. A ball-
peen hammer, for example, was not created for the same purpose 
as a carpenter’s hammer. Rock-climbing hammers are devices to aid 
climbers, not to build things or to do metal work. Or consider the fact 
that a gavel, a judge’s hammer, is mostly a communication tool, as 
well as an indication of a judge’s authority. Now imagine using a 
gavel to help you build a birdhouse or a judge opting to use a 
sledgehammer instead of a gavel. While it might reinforce the 
judge’s authority, it could also put a hole in the desk. 
 
Is technology neutral? Is it just about how a person uses the technol-
ogy? Or does the design of the technology itself affect how one uses 
it? The hammer illustrations suggest that every technology has af-
fordances (benefits) and limitations. It makes certain things possible 
and more likely, and when something is more possible, we tend to 
think about that possibility. Sitting in front of a block of concrete that 
needs removal with a ball-peen hammer in one’s hand will not lead 
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 most of us to start chipping away. Sitting in the same place with a 
sledgehammer is far more likely to lead and inspire us to think about 
taking a swing. The affordances or benefits of a technology lead us 
to consider possibilities that were otherwise hidden. Similarly, tech-
nologies have limitations. The limitations of that ball-peen hammer 
include the fact that it is not an especially useful tool for a person 
needing to break up a concrete block. 
 
Perhaps a different definition will help us think more broadly about 
technology in faith, life, and learning. Technology is applied system-
atic knowledge. We discover something, learn about how something 
works or functions, and then we use that knowledge to design a tool 
or collection of tools to help solve one or more real-world problems. 
That design is technology knowledge applied to meet a need in the 
world. A carpenter needed a way to join different types of wood. As 
human knowledge progressed, people invented nails and hammers 
as technologies to help accomplish such tasks. To say that the ham-
mer and nail are just neutral tools would not make sense in this con-
text. The tool was created to solve a specific problem. Hammers like 
nails more than screws. It is not just about how the wielder of the 
hammer uses it. Regardless of the user’s skill or intent, hammering 
screws produces unhelpful results, as an uninformed, aspiring car-
penter who ignores such facts will learn if he tries pounding a screw 
through two pieces of wood. 
 
There are important exceptions to this. It is possible to “hack” a prob-
lem with a hammer. A hacker can be seen as a person who uses 
technologies and resources in unexpected and often creative ways, 
using a tool to solve a problem for which it was not intended. One 
might, for example, use three hammers to entertain someone by 
showing how a skilled person can juggle them. One might be locked 
in a room and use a hammer to break out. Those old enough to re-
member the television show MacGyver from the 1980s and 1990s, 
are well aware of hacking, using available tools in unexpected ways 
to solve a pressing problem. 
 
While it is possible to ignore the intended purpose of a given tech-
nology, things do not always work out. We might fail in these efforts, 
or we might succeed only to find one or more unintended conse-
quences. I can use a sledgehammer to solve a carpentry problem, 
but it might leave a few more dents and scratches than if I used the 
tool designed for the job. What does this extended example have to 
do with faith, life, and learning in a technological age? I offer five 
important lessons.  
 

1. Our definition of technology is too narrow, not leading us to con-

sider the full impact of our technological decisions on Christian 
schools. 

2. If technologies have intended uses, we are wise to get informed 

about those uses, learning about the affordances and limitations 
of the technologies in our schools and lives. 

3. Current educational technologies are not as simple as the ham-

mer example. Their intended uses are more complex and less 
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obvious. Prayerful and thoughtful reflection, however, can help 
us make wise decisions. 

4. Since the intended purposes of technologies are not as apparent 

as with the hammer example, we are wise to think about unex-
pected consequences of using a given technology in a particular  
way. 

5. There is room for Christian hacking in the contemporary world, 
using technologies in ways that may not have been intended, 
but doing it in pursuit of the mission and ministry of Christian 
education. 

I will expand on each of these five points in the following sections. 

 
Broadening Our Definition 
If we accept the proposal of a broader definition of technology, as 
applied systematic knowledge, we soon discover ourselves sur-
rounded by technologies, even in what we otherwise thought of as 
the most low-tech school or classroom. While many think of technol-
ogy in terms of computer technology, this broader definition invites 
us to think about hundreds, even thousands,of educational technolo-
gies in our schools: bell schedules, pencils and pens, school desks, 
the configuration of classrooms, school architecture and classroom 
design, grading systems, intercom and communication systems, les-
son plan templates, textbooks, curricula, even school policies and 
classroom management models. Each of these is an example of 
applied systematic knowledge, of technology. Inventors of such 
things gathered existing knowledge on the subject, organized it, and 
designed something based upon it to address a specific problem. Of  
course, technology also includes things like the Internet and the de-
vices we use to connect to it, student information systems, 
gradebook software, interactive whiteboards, cell phones, and 
web-based software and tools. 
 
This broader definition of technology shows that educational technol-
ogy and schools are inseparable. There are few schools today that 
do not make heavy use of educational technology. In fact, even the 
way that we study subjects is a technology. Consider the fact that 
many approach social studies as a distinct subject from science, 
math separate from language arts, and art separate from physical 
education. These are not God ordained divisions of content areas. 
They are taxonomies and organizational systems to help us catego-
rize knowledge. This leaves us with a significant challenge and op-
portunity to better understand how all these technologies influence 
the mission and ministry of Christian education. 
 
Exploring Intended Uses, Affordances, and Limitations 
With this broad definition of educational technology, we have the 
challenge and opportunity for prayer and study about the intended 
uses, affordances, and limitations of that technology. Interestingly, 
there are no books (books, by the way, are an educational technolo-
gy) that address the broad spectrum of school technologies in this 
way. We are often left to do our own homework (homework, by the 
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 way, is also an educational technology), which requires more than a 
cursory review of one resource on the subject. Instead, we find our-
selves needing to research, to find lesser known and referenced re-
sources. Books, online sources, and journals on the history of edu-
cation provide helpful starting points. 
 
Consider, for example, the fact that the contemporary letter grade 
system is, in the big picture, a young technology. A review of re-
sources on the history of letter grades reveals that they were first 
used in the United States in the early to middle 19th century. Prior to 
that, education did not use the letter grade system. A fuller under-
standing of this educational technology requires that we examine 
research to discover the intended use of the letter grade system, 
reflecting on the affordances of such a system as well as its limita-
tions. Only when we engage in such work do we begin to discover 
how this technology helps and hinders the mission and ministry of 
Christian schools in a specific time and location. 
 
Neil Postman, a prolific author and social critic from the twentieth 
century, suggested that one ask the question, “What is the problem 
to which this technology is the solution?” Consider that question with 
the grading system. What problem was the grading system created 
to solve? Does that problem still exist today? Is it the best solution 
available? Are there alternative solutions that better align with our 
distinct mission, vision, values, and goals in Christian education? 
 
Sometimes our exploration of such questions provide us with sur-
prising insights into the original purposes of technologies that we use 
in our schools. Continuing with the example of the letter grade sys-
tem, some trace its origins back to a Cambridge University tutor, 
William Farish, who allegedly created the letter grade system be-
cause he was paid per pupil, and this system allowed him to take on 
more students. In other words, it is possible that the letter grade sys-
tem was mainly created to address the financial situation of a single 
educator in the 1700s, and yet look at its varied uses today. 
 
Such explorations also help us, as Christians, to maintain a sense of 
what is flexible and what is nonnegotiable in the mission and ministry 
of Christian schools. By discovering the human origins behind many 
modern technologies associated with schools (things like bells, 
desks in straight rows, traditional letter grade systems, mobile devic-
es, blended and online learning models, etc.), we also find ourselves 
free to explore new options that might better serve our students and 
allow us to more effectively live out our distinct mission and identity. 
We come to further recognize the elements of Christian education 
that are central and should not be changed, while simultaneously 
discovering that the vast majority of our practices, policies, proce-
dures, models, and methods are neither commanded nor forbidden 
in Scripture. We discover the same important truths that inform the 
good and important work of missionaries, namely that there is a dif-
ference between the unchanging truths of God’s word and the con-
stantly changing world in which we live out those truths. 
 
This discovery also empowers us to embrace the doctrine of voca-
tion, which is inherently tied to God’s call for us to love our neigh-
bors. By revealing the original purposes behind many of the educa-
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 tional technologies in our schools, we have the exciting opportunity 
to ask a question that is deeply rooted in the doctrine of vocation. 
What will help us to love our neighbors at this time and in this place 
and context? When we consider use of a given technology, whether 
it is plans for a 1-to-1 device program at our school, a new curricu-
lum, the Common Core State Standards, or a grading and assess-
ment plan for students, we do so with the intention of discovering 
what will best help us love these young neighbors while also consid-
ering how a given technology might tempt us to ignore or fail to love 
other young neighbors. In other words, we seek to surface the af-
fordances and limitations of the technology, given our goal of 
loving our neighbors through the mission and ministry of Christian 
schools. 
 
Looking at the history of technology in education reveals a con-
sistent trend. Many technologies embraced in education are in-
formed by the use of similar or the same technology outside of 
education. Bell schedules, desks in rows, and letter grades to rate 
the quality of student work have parallel practices in factories and 
other workplaces which emerged from the industrial revolution.  
 
Many current web-based technologies, ranging from social media 
(Facebook, Twitter) to image and video sharing services (YouTube, 
Pinterest, Flickr, Vimeo, to productivity applications (Google Docs) 
had significant usage outside of schools before they were widely 
applied in schools. The same is true for cell phones, which initially 
were largely restricted in schools but have more recently become 
tools for teaching and learning. We see this even more clearly with 
the use of games and toys by educators in the classroom (Legos, 
Minecraft, and Wii games). These are often technologies that were 
not initially designed to address educational problems. While some 
companies notice the increased educational interest and seek to 
retool their products and services considering the needs of these 
new customers, others pay less attention to the distinct needs of 
schools. In all cases, these are reminders that companies often do 
have the same values and priorities as learning organizations, espe-
cially Christian schools. This requires teachers and educational lead-
ers to take the responsibility for careful review, leading the charge 
for prayerful educational evaluation of the technologies, again look-
ing at affordances, limitations, and alignment with the school mis-
sion, vision, values, and goals (See Appendix for a list of guides for 
evaluating educational software and other technologies). 

God’s Wisdom in Complex and Messy Situations 
The concept of affordances and limitations is important and distinct 
from asking about what is good or bad. The study of affordances and 
limitations recognizes that any technology has benefits and limits. 
No single technology is free from downsides. As such, it becomes 
important to spend time in prayer, study, and collaboration with col-
leagues to help us make informed decisions about these matters. 
Many newer educational technology decisions in Christian schools 
are informed by learning about new possibilities for teaching and 
learning. For example, using devices connected to the Internet as 
part of formal schooling can be justified in many ways. We return to 
Neil Postman’s question, “What is the problem to which this technol-
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ogy is the solution?” I will add a second question to that: “What pos-
sibilities are made available by this technology?”  
 
Posing these and similar questions to educators and administrators 
in Christian schools will produce different answers. We might hear 
responses like: Using such tools and technology … 

 is an important public relations and marketing strategy, so that 
people see us as providing a comparable education to the public 
schools. 

 gives us access to an unprecedented amount of free resources. 

 helps us equip students for life in a connected world. 

 allows us to create more customized and personalized learning 
experiences for students, which further helps us embrace our 
call to meet the unique needs of each learner and not teach all 
learners as if they were the same. 

 engages students who grew up in the digital world. 

 increases student learning. 

 gives us a chance to help students develop the skills to be life-
long, self-directed learners, using the many free and online re-
sources to continue learning well beyond formal schooling. 

 allows us to connect with people and resources around the 
world, discovering more diverse perspectives and ideas. 

 allows us to connect with Christian classrooms in different parts 
of the world, allowing global partnerships around teaching and 
learning in Christian education that were impossible in the past. 

 
One need not agree with each of these reasons; however, these are 
the types of affordances that people might point to when thinking 
about the adoption of a given technology or set of educational tech-
nologies. It is important to be informed about such affordances for 
each of the educational technologies that we use, as well as ones 
that we consider using in the future. Similarly, it is important to rec-
ognize the limitations and the biases associated with them. Using 
such tools and technology… 

 is expensive and might take away from investments in other criti-
cal  aspects of Christian education ministry. 

 risks exposing young people to inappropriate content and re-
sources. 

 risks distracting students from education fundamentals. 

 can turn the classroom into something that focuses on “bells and 
whistles” and less on the important skills and content that we 
want to teach. 

 can lead to classroom management problems. 

 risks reducing the amount of face-to-face interaction among stu-
dents and teachers. 

 may not allow the teacher adequate control over when and how 
students engage in learning. 

 contributes to young people who are more connected to devices 
than they are to the people in front of them. 

 promotes a digital divide between students with rich technology 
resources at home and those who do not have such resources. 

 
Again, the items in these incomplete lists of affordances and limita-
tions are debatable. Even among prayerful and thoughtful Christians, 
there is significant room for debate about these matters. Nonethe-
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 less, they drive us to be more informed and intentional about our 
choices. That the topics are debatable does not negate the fact that 
the wisdom in God’s Word can inform our decisions. It may well be 
that the wise decision in one context is unwise in another. God’s 
Word is unchanging, but we must engage in ongoing prayer and 
study to discern how the truth of God’s Word best applies in different 
times and contexts.  
 
The vocational question about how to best love a given neighbor or 
group of neighbors helps with this. This is where prayer and God’s 
word remain central to all decision making in Christian education 
ministry, not to mention in the entirety of our lives as Christians. This 
approach also challenges us to pray for God’s help in setting aside 
our personal biases, agendas, and preferences, our attachments to 
educational practices that are neither commanded nor forbidden in 
Scripture, and our temptation to make decisions that are primarily 
about what makes things easiest for us. For example, educational 
innovation can be challenging for students, parents, teachers, and 
administrators. Adoption of a new educational technology may re-
quire relearning, unlearning, uncomfortable ambiguity, changing 
roles of different stakeholders, even the need to explore new and 
different personnel for a given Christian educational ministry. We 
find ourselves challenged to join John the Baptist in saying, “He 
must increase but I must decrease.” We join St. Paul in remember-
ing to “Let each of you look not only to his own interests, but also to 
the interests of others” (Phil. 2:4), and “I have become all things to 
all people so that by all possible means I might save some” (1 Cor. 
9:22). Educational ministry in a constantly changing technological 
world calls for unwavering commitment to our biblical and theological 
foundations, while also being ready to, “lay aside every weight and 
sin which clings so closely, and let us run with endurance the race 
that is set before us” (Heb. 12:1). 
 
In our search for and consideration of new technologies, we may 
learn from bold but humble adoption of educational technology 
throughout the history of Christendom and more specifically Chris-
tian education. In a time of changing technologies, God commanded 
his prophets to use current and sometimes emerging technologies, 
like writing, to pass His words to future generations. In the early 
church, writers of the Epistles used what could be compared to 
blended and distance learning strategies by using the technology of 
writing and letters to teach while being at a distance from a given 
group of people. Church reformers leveraged the printing press and 
mass produced books to communicate and teach. Consider the 
groundbreaking use of catechisms in the history of Christian educa-
tion, the uncomfortable transition of German Christian schools from 
instruction in German (the heart language of the school and church 
leaders) to the language of the majority in the United States. These 
would not have been easy transitions. Each of these new technolo-
gies would have posed affordances and limitations. And yet, God’s 
work was done through them.  
 
The same is true today in Christian education, but technological in-
novation has not stopped. As technologies change, the type of edu-
cation that students need for different times changes, and our minis-
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try opportunities and contexts change. We find ourselves, like Chris-
tian educators before us, grappling with affordances and limitations, 
prayerfully seeking to make decisions that will allow us to continue to 
provide a valuable ministry to diverse young people and families. 
What we cannot afford is to mindlessly or arrogantly rush ahead with 
educational technologies, while labeling those with questions and 
reservations as Luddites, backwards, or self-serving. 
 
The conversation is important. The adoption of writing, for example, 
generated grave concerns for people like Socrates, who believed 
that writing would dull the memory. Of course, it is writing that allows 
us to even know that Socrates supposedly made such a claim. Yet, 
Socrates was correct; reliance on memory has declined. That de-
cline was one limitation produced by the adoption of writing. None-
theless, there were enough affordances to writing that we find ac-
counts in Scripture of God commanding people to write something 
down and to pass it on to future generations. In other words, we 
move forward in the prayerful and thoughtful use of technologies but 
do not move forward blindly or uninformed. We listen and learn from 
different perspectives, carefully evaluate affordances and limitations, 
considering what will best help us love our neighbors in a given con-
text, we pray and study God’s Word for insight, and then we make a 
decision. We can revisit our evaluation over time to ensure that it is 
still a wise direction, but this is the nature of technology in Christian 
education.  
 
When it comes to emerging technologies, we are also wise to heed 
insights from current and emerging research. Early adopters of edu-
cational technologies have little research to help inform analysis of 
the affordances and limitations of a given technology, but the rapid 
sharing and dissemination of knowledge in the information age make 
it possible to garner significant insights, even on some of the newest 
tools.  
 
The iPad was first released in 2010. Early adopters promptly started 
using the technology (or, more accurately, this integrated collection 
of and portal to thousands of technologies), and many Christian edu-
cators spoke about its promise, while others cautioned that only lim-
ited data existed to inform decisions about its adoption in the class-
room.  
 
Fast forward to 2016, and we have significant research on 1-to-1 
programs in schools, hundreds of case studies of iPad and other 
mobile device usage in schools, and thousands of educators and 
administrators with whom we can connect and interview in our own 
deliberations about if or how to use such devices. Nonetheless, 
many still move forward after consulting only one or two sources, not 
taking the time to benefit from the abundant information available on 
the subject. While we can be paralyzed by analyzing the overwhelm-
ing amount of information available, being well informed when mak-
ing such decisions yields ample benefits. Information literacy is a 
critical skill not only for students, but also for teachers and adminis-
trators. 

Even with informed decisions, there can and likely will be unex-
pected consequences to adopting new educational technology. Con-
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 sider the failed 2013 iPad initiative in the Los Angeles public 
schools. A well-resourced team of decision makers met with several 
challenges that led them to cancel the program and collect all of the 
iPads they had recently distributed to each student.  
 
Given the inevitability of unexpected consequences, how do we pre-
pare for this? This brings us back to the mission, vision, values, and 
goals of the school. With any new innovation or educational technol-
ogy adoption, start with a plan to collect data about how things are 
going, what is working well, and what is not working well. In other 
words, the challenge of examining the affordances and limitations is 
not simply something that we do in advance of adopting a new tech-
nology. Continue to explore the potential consequences, even as 
you adopt and use a given technology. This calls for ongoing reflec-
tion and data collection. Develop a plan for the type of information 
you want to collect. Consider the following questions and how a 
school or teacher might collect data on these questions in an ongo-
ing way. 

 What is working 

 What is not working? 

 Are there obvious solutions to what is not working? 

 If there are problems, are they inherent in the technology or do 
they arise from our use of technology? 

 Are we noticing any unexpected consequences? 

 How is this helping to increase student learning and engage-
ment? 

 How is it helping us to pursue our mission, vision, values, and 
goals? 

 How is this technology changing the way that we teach and stu-
dents learn? What are the benefits and drawbacks to these 
changes? 

 Since technologies have values and tend to emphasize certain 
things and minimize others, what is the technology amplifying 
and what is it minimizing? 

 Since we are called to be responsible stewards of our resources, 
are the benefits worth the cost of this investment? 

 What adjustments could be made to make this work better? 

 Are there any students who are not benefitting or are being 
harmed by the adoptions of this new technology? What can be 
done to help them? 

 
There are many ways, both formal and informal, to collect and ana-
lyze answers to these question. Teacher and student journaling, 
weekly surveys from different stakeholders (parents, teachers, stu-
dents), setting time aside to informally talk through one or more such 
questions with students, conducting informal focus groups and indi-
vidual interviews to get different viewpoints, and teacher-collected 
data about student work and behaviors with the new educational 
technology adoption are all great places to start. Such activities al-
low us to monitor progress and make adjustments that help us re-
main focused on the distinct mission, vision, values, and goals of our 
Christian school. 
 

Continue to explore the potential 

consequences, even as you adopt 

and use a give technology. 
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 The Christian Education Hacker and Designer 
As noted earlier, hacking can be understood as using technologies 
in unintended ways to accomplish a desired goal. Of course, this is 
not using hacker in the popular sense of illegally breaking into peo-
ple’s bank accounts or other malicious computer activities. While 
some use the term pejoratively, hacking also relates to people who 
enjoy figuring out how things work, modifying and repurposing 
things, and using technologies in creative, unexpected, and innova-
tive ways. From this definition, one might argue that hacking is a 
critical skill for Christian educators and administrators.  
 
Christian educators work in a broad educational landscape rich with 
technologies, programs, curricula, innovations, and policies and laws 
from government and external organizations. Christian schools need 
to respect government authorities and external agencies, respond to 
trends and innovations but also remain faithful to the distinct mission 
and ministry of Christian education. At times, conflicts between ex-
ternal pressures and the mission of Christian schools is apparent. In 
other instances, the differences are more nuanced. Either way, 
Christian schools find themselves in a situation where they need to 
modify or adapt the educational technologies (keep in mind the cur-
rent broad use of that term) that are used in public schools. 
  
Consider, for example, the popular Love and Logic for Teachers dis-
cipline program used in many schools. This program represents a 
philosophy of discipline supported by some research and embraced 
by many private, public, and parochial schools. It deals, however, 
with many topics about which God’s Word has much to say. When 
Christian schools embrace this, they do not do so in the same way 
as public schools using the same program. Parents, teachers, and 
administrators at Christian schools have the challenge of hacking 
such a resource, being more explicit about the role of God’s word as 
part of discipline and classroom management. The same is true 
when schools adopt digital citizenship curricula, leverage predevel-
oped blended and online courses from outside sources, and use 
educational software. Most of these are not designed from a Chris-
tian perspective, requiring faithful Christian teachers to hack them or 
be active in repurposing them in ways that ensure God’s Word is 
clear and evident. 

With this in mind, conversation about the importance of 21
st
 century 

design is growing. This is, in many ways, not a new conversation. It 
considers the importance of designing learning opportunities and 
spaces that are conducive to student learning and engagement. 
Within the church, this general concept has been alive and well for 
centuries. For example, consider the many design considerations 
that go into a sanctuary. Intentional planning represents the beliefs 
and values of the church. That is why so many Christian churches 
have the pulpit, altar, and baptismal font as the three most significant 
features in a sanctuary. This becomes a visual reminder of the 
Christian emphasis upon Word and Sacrament. The interior design 
speaks to the doctrines of the church. 
 
The Importance of Design Thinking in a Technological Age 
Many think of integrating the faith as a matter of design, particularly 
designing a classroom that has ample reminders of our Christian 
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distinctiveness. There may be posters of Bible passages and Chris-
tian quotes, lists of central teachings like the Ten Commandments, 
graphic organizers that help students to make sense of various 
Christian teachings, or art that depicts Christian messages or evokes 
reflection about Christian teachings. And yet, design goes beyond 
the physical space. It includes classroom rules, formal and informal 
policies and procedures, decisions about educational technologies, 
and the intentional planning and preparation of lesson plans and 
learning experiences. It is within the very design of such things that 
tenets of the Christian faith are emphasized, minimized, or even dis-
torted. Consider the following examples as both positive and nega-
tive illustrations of design. 
 
Design Illustration #1 
Imagine a scenario in a Christian school where the teacher provides 
students with a checklist of skills to master. These could be skills 
related to grammar, math, science, music, or any other topic. 
Throughout the year, the teacher provides mini-lessons, helpful illus-
trations and examples, one-on-one guidance, opportunities for prac-
tice, and plenty of good feedback that can help each learner pro-
gress toward mastering each skill. As a reward for mastering 
all of the items on the list, the teacher provides individual students 
with a digital badge to display on private blogs created by the teach-
er. The student also gets a cross necklace inscribed with the words, 
“Jesus Loves Me!” 
 
This teaching and learning design may appear to have some merit. It 
provides students with an opportunity to take ownership of their 
learning, potentially including rich computer-based activities. The 
checklist is a clear statement of what students are expected to learn. 
The teacher provided numerous planned learning experiences to 
help students accomplish the items on the list. 
 
What about the reward at the end? If you asked the teacher, he 
might indicate that this is part of how he integrates the faith. After all, 
a cross necklace and digital badge reminding the students of God’s 
love is certainly not something that will be provided to students in a 
public school. That is indeed distinctly Christian. And yet, what po-
tential messages does such a design communicate? What about the 
students who do not master all of the items on the list? And how 
might this be understood by different students at different develop-
mental stages? At the risk of being overly dramatic, imagine the final 
day of class, with all but two students walking out of class proudly 
bearing their “Jesus Loves Me!” necklaces, and two lone students 
walking away, not having mastered all of the items on the list and not 
“earning” a physical and digital reminder of God’s unconditional love 
manifested by His Son’s sacrifice on the cross. Looking at it from this 
perspective challenges us to consider if this well-intentioned design 
and integration of the faith may risk distorting law and Gospel. 
 
Design Illustration #2 
This teacher has been nurturing third graders at the Christian Ele-
mentary School for the past 25 years; while she is a wonderfully cre-
ative teacher, some things have stayed the same year after year. 
Here is a quick snapshot of a typical Monday in her class. Each 
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Monday morning, when the students enter the room, the lights are 
on, the teacher greets each student by name, there is quiet Christian 
music playing. The teacher has a series of three or four different  
“devotion centers” set up for the children, all related to a theme for 
the week. If the Bible theme for the week is “Rejoicing in the Lord 
always,” you can be sure that the music playing is related to rejoic-
ing, and the devotion centers will all have something to do with that 
topic, only experienced in different ways. One might be a reading 
center with a selection of Bible and other stories that relate to rejoic-
ing, along with a large white board for students to jot down quotes or 
ideas they liked from one or more of the stories. Another center 
might be an art center, with a collection of pictures, art supplies 
ready to be used to create “rejoicing art,” and even a pair of digital 
cameras that students can use to capture moments of rejoicing. A 
third station would have a coat rack that the teacher covered in con-
struction paper and turned into an artificial tree. This is the prayer 
tree, and students are invited to draw or write a brief rejoicing prayer 
and hang it on the tree. There is always one more station in her 
class as well. This week, it is just an empty space with only one thing 
in it, a simple plain poster in block letters, “Philippians 4:4.” 
 
By the third Monday of the year, students know what to do when 
they arrive in the morning. They each choose a station, follow the 
instructions provided at the station, and then move on with their oth-
er morning activities. While the theme and details of the centers 
change each week, this pattern continues week after week. As class 
starts, the teacher draws the children together, introduces them to 
the theme with a story or illustration, and invites them to begin shar-
ing about what they did or created in the centers. She might take a 
prayer off of the prayer tree, ask students about their favorite quotes 
in the reading center, and have a student or two share some of their 
rejoicing art. And she always has a wonderful way of creatively pull-
ing it all together and preparing students for a week of thinking 
about, experiencing, and learning about the theme. 
 
This is an elaborate design. It clearly takes significant time to create 
and implement something like this week after week. Of course, a 
veteran teacher builds from year to year and soon has a treasure 
chest of great ideas and resources to reuse. In this case, notice the 
many design considerations. Notice how she organized her day in 
such a way that she was finished with her own devotions in time to 
greet the students by name. “We have a God who knows us by 
name,” the teacher might explain, “so I want to know and use your 
names too.” Notice also that this is planned for each Monday morn-
ing, and it is the first activity of the week. “It is my little way of helping 
the students recognize that God comes first,” explains the teacher. 
Besides that, it establishes a theme that can be built upon and refer-
enced throughout the week. There is more to this design as well. 
You can find hundreds of examples of Christian classrooms that 
start off each Monday morning with a devotion, but there is some- 
thing different about this design. The teacher might explain that 
teaching the faith is more than telling the faith. This teacher wants to 
create a classroom where students are not just active participants in 
the devotion, but active participants in helping shape the devotions. 
By having centers as the first activity of the day, each individual stu-
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dent is invited to be a co-creator of the weekly devotions. And what 
about that fourth center, the empty space? “Long ago, I learned that 
God often has profound things to teach me through the children and 
that sometimes it is best for me to get out of the way. So, why not 
create a blank center, a blank slate where students can create and 
initiate something related to the theme for the week?” 
 
Design Illustration #3 
Now consider a small Christian high school in an affluent area. The 
parents have high expectations for their students, with 95 percent of 
the student body college bound. At the same time, it is a newer 
school with a smaller faculty. This makes it difficult to offer many 
electives or higher level courses. To address this, the school admin-
istrator was delighted to discover a program through the state com-
munity college system, allowing students to take free online courses 
that receive dual credit. Students count the class toward high school 
graduation requirements, plus it goes on a college transcript, allow-
ing them to bring those credits to a university of their choice. The 
school works out an arrangement with the community college and 
adds several upper level electives to the curriculum. 
 
Of course, this is a public community college, so the curriculum is 
neither approached nor presented from a distinctly Christian per-
spective. To address this, the administrator, teachers, and parents 
design a special supplement for students taking these classes. Stu-
dents participating in a community college class schedule a weekly 
lunch meeting with one of the teachers at the high school with the 
explicit goal of discussing a Christian/biblical perspective on what 
they are learning. At times, the connections are not readily apparent, 
for example, when studying math. This supplemental conversation, 
however, presents a trained Christian teacher with an exciting oppor-
tunity to explicitly and intentionally guide students in thinking about 
the implications of a Christian worldview upon the various subjects. 
In addition, it provides guidance in instances where students are 
conflicted about how to live out their faith in a secular learning con-
text. 
 
This design consideration entailed using a largely secular curriculum 
and learning experience but creating an important supplement that 
helped the school remain faithful to its mission, vision, values, and  
educational goals. While there are certainly many perspectives on 
such a situation, and there are likely many possible ways to ap-
proach it, this example illustrates how adoption of something new 
requires consideration of affordances, limitations, and modifications 
so that the school’s mission is not jeopardized.  
 
Each of these illustrations describes ways in which design plays a 
role in teaching and integrating the faith in ways that go beyond faith 
modeling and involve the elements included in the construction of a 
school, class, lesson, or school day. These considerations are criti-
cally important to Christian schools adopting new technologies, cur-
ricula, and resources. 
 
The Values-Laden Nature of Technology, Design Thinking, and 
Integrating the Faith 
It is important for parents, teachers, and administrators to learn 
about the values-laden nature of technology so they can make 
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informed decisions on which technologies to use and how to use 
them. The study of life in a technological world becomes part of the 
content, integrated across the curriculum. Such a practice helps 
teachers guide students into thinking about the nature of faith and 
life in an increasingly digital world. 
 
Doctors have an interesting task. They have a calling to aid people 
in seeing the world clearly. An eye exam includes tests that seek to 
determine the extent to which you can see clearly and accurately or 
to determine if you have any conditions or ailments that put your fu-
ture vision at risk. Based upon such tests, the doctor provides a pre-
scription or potential intervention, anything ranging from eye drops to 
glasses or contacts to corrective surgery. To accomplish these 
tasks, the doctor must know what constitutes good vision and poor 
vision. 
 
The Christian teacher has a similar task: to help students see Truth 
as represented in God’s Word and God’s world as clearly as possi-
ble. It is ultimately the Great Physician who aids us in clear vision. 
This psalmist reminds us that this is our plea, “Open my eyes that I 
may behold wondrous things out of your law” (Ps. 119:18). 
 
In 2 Kings 6, Elisha and his servant woke up early in the morning to 
find King Aram’s army surrounding the town, prepared to capture 
Elisha. Upon seeing the soldiers and chariots, Elisha’s servant was 
clearly distraught. “What shall we do?”  
 
“Don’t be afraid,” the prophet answered. “Those who are with us are 
more than those who are with them.”  
 
And Elisha prayed, “‘Open his eyes, Lord so that he may see.” Then 
the Lord opened the servant’s eyes, and he saw the hills full of hors-
es and chariots of fire all around Elisha.” God helped Elisha’s serv-
ant to see things as they really were. God did this, however, upon 
the request and through the tutelage of the prophet Elisha.  
 
The Christian teacher, in some ways, plays a similar role. The role of 
integrating the faith is not a creative task. Rather, it is the task of 
guiding students to see where God is already present and at work 
and aiding students to recognize the many ways in which God’s 
Word makes sense of the world. It is about sharing God’s Word and 
watching the Holy Spirit work, helping us to see ourselves and our 
world with clarity: We are creations of God, loved by God, born into 
sin, redeemed by our Savior. We have value, meaning, and a mis-
sion all revealed in God’s holy Word. To participate in the teaching 
ministry is to stand alongside learners as God guides us all into see-
ing such things more clearly. 
 
Not only does the teacher help students to see truth, but the teacher 
also helps them learn ways in which to go about discerning truth 
from falsehood, good from evil, right from wrong, and wisdom from 
foolishness. Each student enters the class with different life  

The study of life in a technological 

world becomes part of the content 

integrated across the curricu-

lum...helps teachers guide students 

into thinking about the nature of 

faith and life in an increasingly 

digital world. 

The Christian teacher has a simi-

lar task: to help students see Truth 

as represented in God’s Word and 

God’s world as clearly as possi-

ble. 

...it is the task of guiding students 

to see where God is already pre-

sent and at work and aiding stu-

dents to recognize the many ways 

in which God’s Word makes sense 

in the world. 



 15 

 

experiences, beliefs, and values, all of which impact the way in 
which students see and make sense of the world.  
 
As any teacher can verify, students do not enter most lessons as 
blank slates, even if they have never heard about a topic. The 
youngest children come with myriad ideas about everything from 
physics to politics, sports teams to health, much informed by the 
heavy media diet of the typical young person today. They have be-
liefs and values about family, entertainment, history, life and death, 
what constitutes a good story, the role of numbers in the world, the 
value of reading, what constitutes right and wrong, and even wheth-
er or not God exists. Even when students may not have thought 
about one of these things, they come with life experiences and be-
liefs that influence how they will think about such topics. Please do 
not mistake this as only applying to older students. I contend that 
this is equally true, perhaps especially true of the youngest children 
in our schools, those in Christian preschools and kindergarten, as 
much as of those in Christian universities. 
 
This is the realm of what some refer to as worldview studies, explor-
ing the ways in which a person’s beliefs and values impact their un-
derstanding of the world. Every subject that is taught includes claims 
about truth and morality. In math, one plus one equals two, not sev-
en. In science, carbon dioxide consists of carbon and oxygen. In 
grammar, a sentence ends in a period rather than a comma. In read-
ing, each word has a meaning that aids the reader in understanding 
the text. This is evident, perhaps so evident that it is sometimes tak-
en for granted. Many argue that starting at this foundational point is 
important when it comes to thinking about the Christian teacher as 
an eye doctor. 
 
Every subject in school includes claims about truth, and these claims 
vary in the extent to which they do or do not align with what God has 
revealed in his Word. The skeptic may point out the many instances 
where this is not the case. What does God’s Word have to say spe-
cifically about addition or English grammar, for example? This  miss-
es the point of the teacher as eye doctor. This perspective does not 
claim that every single topic requires the integration of a relevant 
Bible passage. Instead, it is more broadly concerned with seeking 
after and cultivating a clear and accurate view of God’s Word and  
God’s world. That requires constantly examining truth claims, asking 
if God’s Word has anything to say about it, whether one is studying 
math, social studies, physical education, or theology. It is more of a 
mindset than a series of individual acts. It is not, however, a quick 
and easy task. It requires significant time and effort. Important topics 
and issues can easily be overlooked. It requires that teachers com-
mit to a relentless exploration for the relevance of God’s Word in all 
aspects of life and to inviting students to join in that exploration. 
 
How does this relate to the role of technology in Christian schools? 
Just as God’s Word sheds light on our thinking about different disci-
plines, it also applies to our exploration of the increasingly digital and 
technological world in which we live. Many messages that young 
people read and write today do not come in the form of traditional 
text. They come through text messages, email, hypertext, YouTube  
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videos, digital images, films, music, and other aspects of digital cul-
ture. As such, it is not just technology we use in Christian education. 
Sometimes it is something that we study across the disciplines.  
 
In math, we examine the ways in which people use technology and 
media to accurately and deceptively represent statistics and the 
world of numbers. In social studies and language arts, we not only 
use video clips and other technologies, but we also find opportunities 
to think and learn about how ideas can be modified depending on 
which technology is used. In language arts, we consider the af-
fordances and limitations of communication in different forms and 
using different technologies. We study digital citizenship, considering 
how our Christian faith informs our decisions about when and how to 
use different technologies, whether it be video games, social media, 
or cell phones. All of this becomes part of the content of the Chris-
tian school, giving students a chance to understand how God’s Word 
applies in the digital world. 
 
The SIT Method—Surface, Integrate, Teach 
One practical way to employ some of these ideas is to use the SIT 
method, which is both an acronym and a reminder that this task re-
quires that we slow down, have a seat, and engage in some careful 
thought, prayer, and study about the various lessons that we teach. 
This method yields more intentional integration of the faith, even 
when we are using tools, resources, and curricula that are not explic-
itly Christian. 
 
Surface 
The first step in SIT is to focus on a single lesson plan and its ac-
companying resources: textbook, other readings, videos, PowerPoint 
documents, additional educational technologies, or any other re-
sources that may be used by teacher and student. A Bible (or digital 
equivalent) with a concordance that allows one to quickly and easily 
find passages related to various topics and keywords, is useful.  
 
Begin with a brainstorming session to record as many answers as 
possible to the following question: What topics, issues, ideas, val-
ues, beliefs, or truth claims in this lesson (and the accompany re-
sources) relate to one or more ideas taught in God’s Word? This is 
not a simple task, it requires the teacher to have what I call a “deep 
well” of knowledge about God’s Word and about the lesson and re-
sources. The better a teacher knows God’s Word and the content in 
the lesson, the easier this will be. A new teacher will need to devote 
more time and energy than a more experienced teacher. And experi-
enced public school teachers now teaching in a Christian school 
may need to challenge themselves to revisit long known lessons, but 
this time with God’s Word open.  
 
This step is not about making up contrived connections with God’s 
Word. It is about surfacing the faith topics and issues that are al-
ready present (sometimes subtly, sometimes more obviously) in the 
lesson, resources, and technologies. It is a task where one mixes 
three deep wells of knowledge: knowledge about the content, 
knowledge about God’s Word, and knowledge about the specific 
students that one is teaching. 
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 Integrate 
The surfacing stage is really a form of brainstorming. As a result, 
one is likely to surface more issues than are wise or possible to 
teach in a given lesson. Similarly, one will surface topics and 
issues that are not developmentally appropriate for all audiences. 
This second stage, integrating, is about refining and focusing one’s 
plans. To integrate is to prayerfully select one or two items from the 
surfacing brainstorm and to intentionally plan ways to help students 
explore that topic alongside other things that students will learn with-
in a lesson or unit. The idea is to make these one or two ideas inte-
grated and embedded parts of the lesson, and the first step in doing 
this is to write a learning objective for the identified topic and include 
it alongside the other stated learning objectives for the lesson. Write 
it out as a statement that describes what one wants the students to 
learn related to this faith issue. 
 
Teach 
Having brainstormed (surfaced), selected an important topic from the 
brainstorm, and written a specific learning objective (integrate), the 
teacher is ready to plan for actually teaching it. Ask, “How will I help 
students explore and learn this faith lesson alongside everything 
else that I am teaching?” This comes back to the design approach to 
teaching the faith, as one engages in planning one or more specific 
and intentional learning activities that will help students grapple with 
and learn the stated objective. This might include selecting readings 
from God’s Word or other sources, planning thought-provoking dis-
cussion questions, bringing in a guest speaker on the topic, having 
students create a project or product that integrates the faith issue, or 
almost any other learning activity. This should involve intentionally 
focusing upon these topics and should be a planned and integrated 
part of the lesson rather than an “add on” or after thought. 
 
Reimagining Christian Education in a Technological World 
Broadening our understanding of the definition of educational tech-
nology, careful study of the affordances and limitations of technolo-
gy, and helping students grapple with the nature of faith, life, and 
learning in the digital world offer promise for the future of Christian 
education. This analysis of the technologies of Christian schools 
helps us distinguish that which is essential, important, and merely 
present. We gain confidence and clarity about those central tenets of 
Christian education to which we remain uncompromisingly commit-
ted. We cling to the entirety of Christian doctrine as taught in God’s 
Word, not simply as a body of knowledge but as teachings that in-
form the policies, practices, and culture of our schools. 
 
In spite of that uncompromising foundation, a detailed vision for the 
nature of Christian schooling is not explicit in the Scriptures or the 
Christian Confessions. While there are many good and useful texts 
that communicate potential visions for Christian education in the 
contemporary world, there remains significant room for different pos-
sibilities. Even as some authors and educators advocate for particu-
lar approaches to schooling and curricula, we live in a time of un-
precedented change, innovation, and experimentation in education. 
Homeschooling, virtual schooling, and innovative models of charter 
schools are among the fastest growing trends in P12 education. As  
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parents have more educational choices for their children than ever 
before, Christian schools have the challenge of deciding when, if, 
and how to explore different models.  

Consider this list of educational innovations that gained increased 
attention and adoption in schools over the last several years: new 
models of project-based learning and game-based learning, the 
flipped classroom and other forms of blended learning, mobile devic-
es in the classroom, bring your own device schools and other mod-
els of 1-to-1 programs, social media and cloud computing, online 
learning, massive open online courses, adaptive learning software, 
eBooks and ereaders, maker spaces in education, the common core 
state standards, standards-based assessment, rapid advancement 
in learning analytics technologies, and the open digital badge initia-
tive that promises to bridge the gap between learning in and outside 
of school. Newspaper headlines and education literature abound in 
bold estimates or predictions about how one or more of these will 
impact the future of education. 

What will the schools of the future look like? What will Christian 
schools of the future look like? How will the role of teacher and stu-
dent change or stay the same? How will current and emerging edu-
cational technologies impact this future? Which aspects of current 
schools will persist? Which ones will be replaced with alternatives? 
While we can make predictions, we do not know the answers to 
these questions. We can, however, help create an answer, but 
doing so requires persistent prayer and study of God’s Word, analy-
sis of the trends and possibilities, persistent conversation about the 
affordance and limitations of the technologies in our schools, and the 
courage to make decisions that are informed by these things. 
 
 
APPENDIX  
How do you decide upon an educational product? Do you use a sys-
tematic process, go with your gut, choose what is most popular, or 
perhaps go with suggestions from trusted colleagues? The task of 
sifting through thousands of options can be overwhelming, even 
impossible. However, when you do look at a product or narrow down 
your list, there are resources to help you evaluate it. This is not a five
-minute process, but if you are going to make a significant invest-
ment and/or make a decision that impacts students and your educa-
tional ministry focus, it calls for a deliberate, systematic review. A 
careful review of educational products is hard work, but our students 
are worth it. In fact, you could even involve students in using one or 
more of these tools to help review products. 
 
9 Questions for Evaluating Educational Innovation 
This short document provides a helpful list of important questions to 
ask when you are evaluating educational products. It is simple but 
gets at many of the important factors to consider when selecting a 
product or service. 
 
The Pearson Efficacy Framework 
Pearson Education created a framework for evaluating the efficacy 
of educational products. This report outlines that process. It is a  
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 lengthy document (56 pages) but worth the time and effort to read. It 
will give you a robust understanding of which factors to consider 
when you review educational products. 
 
The Online Efficacy Tool 
This is really just an extension of the previous resource. It is a link to 
a tool created by Person to evaluate educational products. It will take 
you through the review of a product based upon outcomes, evi-
dence, planning and implementation, and capacity to deliver (the 
broad categories included in the Pearson Efficacy Framework). 
 
Conducting and Reporting Product Evaluation Research 
Many companies provide “research” to back up the value of their 
product. This document is a guide for companies on how to conduct 
such studies of their products. It comes from the Software and Infor-
mation Industry Association. Reading this will give you a better un-
derstanding of how to judge the quality of a research report about a 
given educational product. 
 
How to Evaluate Educational Software and Products 
This is an older resource (from 2000), but the list of things to consid-
er/review is still excellent. It is a short, two-page resource with a ro-
bust list of considerations. 
 
“Neil Postman and Media Ecology” 
This short article introduces you to a series of simple questions that 
can help surface some of the unexpected consequences of various 
technologies. 
 
All Scripture quotations are from The Holy Bible, English Standard Version, 
copyright © 2001 by Crossway Bibles, a division of Good News Publishers. 
Used by permission. All rights reserved. 

 
 
Bernard Bull serves as Assistant Vice President of Academics, work-
ing mainly with the accelerated learning and continuing and distance 
education; Associate Professor of Education; and Director of the MS 
in Education — Educational Technology at Concordia University 
Wisconsin. He holds a BA in education, history, and theology; and 
MA in curriculum and instruction; and MLS (liberal studies); an EdD. 
In instructional technology, and a certificate in distance learning and 
teaching from the University of Wisconsin—Madison. 

http://efficacy.pearson.com/efficacy-tool/
http://empiricaleducation.com/pdfs/SIIAguidelines.pdf
http://blog.practutor.com/how-to-evaluate-an-educational-software/
http://etale.org/main/2009/04/17/neil-postman-and-media-ecology/
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